
BID SUMMARY TOTAL REPORT
Major Category: AS ART SUPPLIES

Vendor
Total Bid
  Amount

Discount For
Total Award

Final Bid
  Amount

Total Response
    Amount

bpbidsum

THE ART STORE     5,242.57    5,242.57          0.00 No Bid 178 Items   13,749.24

CASCADE SCHOOL SUPPLIES INC.       773.90      773.90          0.00 No Bid 157 Items   12,330.49

FISK CAMERA SHOP     3,624.52    3,624.52          0.00 No Bid 255 Items    5,073.87

LAKESHORE LEARNING MATERIALS        41.77       41.77          0.00 No Bid 260 Items    3,500.84

METCO SUPPLY INC.       738.00      738.00          0.00 No Bid 220 Items   12,955.59

NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLY     1,766.94    1,766.94          0.00 No Bid 255 Items    3,383.88

PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS     1,835.52    1,835.52          0.00 No Bid 176 Items   11,648.46

QUILL CORPORATION       494.73      494.73          0.00 No Bid 230 Items   12,407.77

SCHOOL SPECIALTY, LLC     2,234.60    2,234.60          0.00 No Bid 164 Items   11,153.81

W B MASON     3,745.99    3,745.99          0.00 No Bid 216 Items    6,847.89

    20,498.54    20,498.54Totals 286 Total Items
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